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From Book 1:

A funeral, a ghost, a murder . . . It's all in a day's work for emma lee raines . . .

Bopped on the head from a falling plastic Santa, local undertaker Emma Lee Raines is told she's suffering
from “funeral trauma.”   It's trauma all right, because the not-so-dearly departed keep talking to her. Take
Ruthie Sue Payne—innkeeper, gossip queen, and arch-nemesis of Emma Lee's granny—she's adamant that
she didn't just fall down those stairs. She was pushed.

Ruthie has no idea who wanted her pushing up daisies. All she knows is that she can't cross over until the
matter is laid to eternal rest. In the land of the living, Emma Lee's high-school crush, Sheriff Jack Henry
Ross, isn't ready to rule out foul play. Granny Raines, the widow of Ruthie's ex-husband and co-owner of the
Sleepy Hollow Inn, is the prime suspect. Now Emma Lee is stuck playing detective or risk being haunted
forever. 
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From reader reviews:

Steven Slaughter:

The book Ghostly Southern Mysteries (4 Book Series) make you feel enjoy for your spare time. You can use
to make your capable far more increase. Book can to be your best friend when you getting tension or having
big problem along with your subject. If you can make reading a book Ghostly Southern Mysteries (4 Book
Series) for being your habit, you can get more advantages, like add your personal capable, increase your
knowledge about several or all subjects. You could know everything if you like wide open and read a
publication Ghostly Southern Mysteries (4 Book Series). Kinds of book are a lot of. It means that, science
guide or encyclopedia or other folks. So , how do you think about this guide?

Betty Terry:

Here thing why this specific Ghostly Southern Mysteries (4 Book Series) are different and reliable to be
yours. First of all studying a book is good but it really depends in the content from it which is the content is
as delicious as food or not. Ghostly Southern Mysteries (4 Book Series) giving you information deeper since
different ways, you can find any guide out there but there is no guide that similar with Ghostly Southern
Mysteries (4 Book Series). It gives you thrill reading journey, its open up your current eyes about the thing
this happened in the world which is possibly can be happened around you. It is easy to bring everywhere like
in area, café, or even in your method home by train. When you are having difficulties in bringing the
imprinted book maybe the form of Ghostly Southern Mysteries (4 Book Series) in e-book can be your
choice.

Dolores Crook:

A lot of e-book has printed but it differs from the others. You can get it by web on social media. You can
choose the best book for you, science, comedy, novel, or whatever by searching from it. It is referred to as of
book Ghostly Southern Mysteries (4 Book Series). Contain your knowledge by it. Without departing the
printed book, it could possibly add your knowledge and make you happier to read. It is most crucial that, you
must aware about reserve. It can bring you from one spot to other place.

Jessica Bowman:

Reading a book make you to get more knowledge from that. You can take knowledge and information
originating from a book. Book is composed or printed or highlighted from each source which filled update of
news. In this particular modern era like at this point, many ways to get information are available for anyone.
From media social such as newspaper, magazines, science guide, encyclopedia, reference book, novel and
comic. You can add your knowledge by that book. Do you want to spend your spare time to open your book?
Or just seeking the Ghostly Southern Mysteries (4 Book Series) when you essential it?
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